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EDGEWARE’S STREAMPILOT GOES LIVE WITH TV 2 SUMO
Edgeware’s multi-CDN delivery control platform is now deployed by Norway’s leading 
commercial streaming service TV 2 Sumo

Stockholm, Sweden – July 1, 2020 –  today announces that its cloud-based multi-CDN Edgeware
delivery control platform, , is going into live production with , the leading StreamPilot TV 2 Sumo
streaming service run by Norwegian commercial public broadcaster. This follows a successful testing 
period with TV 2 Sumo, as well as trials with other customers.

With the ability to switch, modify and even terminate in-session delivery to optimize quality of 
experience (QoE), StreamPilot gives broadcasters and content providers control of their OTT TV 
delivery in multi-CDN environments. Its strategic location in the control plane, between the CDN and 
the client, makes StreamPilot completely agnostic to both CDN and client, allowing users to measure, 
manage and get visibility of the delivery in real time. The StreamPilot cloud service has successfully 
been tested by TV 2 Sumo, who will continue to evaluate other services on the StreamPilot platform 
to further enhance its TV delivery.

“As more TV suppliers and operators transition to deploy their technology in the cloud, the ability to 
quickly test and add new features and functionalities – and thus utilize data analytics and machine 
learning algorithms – allows them to better manage and improve their services,” said Kalle 
Henriksson, founder, and product manager for StreamPilot, at Edgeware. “Edgeware has rich 
experience in building mission-critical delivery mechanisms for streaming and network control and 
working with TV 2 Sumo has brought that to the fore. We’re proud to be selected by one of the 
leading European OTT providers and take this experience into mission-critical cloud environments. It’
s been a privilege to work with such an experienced and technically-savvy team as we have with our 
friends at TV 2 Sumo.”

StreamPilot’s recently-announced  feature provides an automated QoE optimization AutoPilot
functionality and a unified presentation of multi-CDN session data. StreamPilot is offered as a SaaS 
solution.

StreamPilot can be experienced virtually by booking a virtual demo .here

This agreement is strategically important for Edgeware but will not materially impact the result of 2020.

The information was submitted for publication, through the agency of the contact person set out 
below, at 07:30 CET on July 1, 2020.
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About Edgeware
Edgeware supplies operators and content providers with systems to deliver modern TV services over 

https://www.edgeware.tv/
https://www.edgeware.tv/product/streampilot/
https://sumo.tv2.no/velkommen
https://www.edgeware.tv/news-events/edgeware-adds-automated-qoe-optimization-to-its-multi-cdn-control-platform-streampilot/
http://info.edgeware.tv/virtual-demos
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the Internet at a huge scale. Edgeware’s unique technology provides an outstanding viewing 
experience that allows its customers to retain control of their content. Edgeware has more than 200 
customers and is headquartered in Stockholm, Sweden, with staff across Europe, Asia and the 
Americas. For more information, please visit www.edgeware.tv
 

 About TV 2
TV 2 is the largest commercial TV channel in Norway, and part of the TV 2 media house which has a 
number of established brands such as TV 2 Nyhetskanalen, TV 2 Zebra, TV 2 Livsstil, TV 2 Sport 1 
and 2, TV 2 Sumo, TV2.no and TV 2 Skole.
 
TV 2 is part of Egmont which is one of the largest media groups in the Nordics with 6600 employees 
and activities in 30 countries. TV 2’s owner Egmont is a foundation which each year distributes more 
than 100 million NOK to give children and young people a better life. Egmont has more than 700 
magazines, publishers, Klikk.no, Nordisk Film, cinemas, and several co-owned companies.
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